Your complimentary
use period has ended.
Thank you for using
PDF Complete.

Click Here to upgrade te

Unlimited Pages and EX <dramirez@indelek.com>

[tubre de 2014 10:48 a.m.

Para: Enrique Bustamante

cc: Isabel Pineda; Rogelio Sandoval Uvina
Asunto: Re: MUNICIPIO DE JUAREZ
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On Oct 23, 2014, at 10:20 AM, Enrique Bustamante <ebustamante@indelek.com> wrote:

Mas bien seria 50,000
Para llenar el formato ya estd por llegarnos un transformador de $22,620.00 mn ya con iva

comente
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te correo es informacién
Sste mensaje no es el
destinatario indicado, ni empleado o agente responsable de entregar este correo a su
destinatario, se le hace saber que la distribucién o copia de esta comunicacién esta
estrictamente prohibida. Si Usted recibié esta comunicacién por error, por favor notifique
inmediatamente a quien lo envié y destruya dicho correo. Gracias.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: Unless indicated otherwise or obvious from the nature of the
transmittal, the information contained in this e-mail is confidential information Intended for
the use of the individual or entity named above. If the reader of this message is not the
intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible to deliver it to the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error,
please immediately notify the sender and destroy such e-mail. Thank you

De: Rogelio Sandoval [mailto:rsandoval@indelek.com]
Enviado el: jueves, 23 de octubre de 2014 10:14 a. m.
Para: 'David Ramirez'

CC: 'Lic Isabel Pineda'; 'Enrique Bustamante'

Asunto: MUNICIPIO DE JUAREZ

Buen dia

El cliente municipio de Judrez tiene de crédito $5,000.00
Serd bueno aumentarle el crédito a $20,000.00

En espera de sus comentarios

Saludos
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